

LAMPIRAN
LAPORAN TAHUNAN KPK
2018



ASSET TRACING,
EVIDENCE
MANAGEMENT
AND EXECUTION
UNIT ANNUAL
REPORT 2018|
ATTACHMENTS 1

ASSET RESTORATION, TRACING AND AUCTION

EFFECTIVE YEAR	NAME OF CONVICT	DETAILS OF EVIDENCE	FAIR VALUE (Rp)	SOLD VALUE (Rp)	AUCTION DATE	REMARKS
2017	Budi Supriyanto	1 (one) Apple smartphone, model A1532 (Apple Iphone 5C) serial number F78LD58MFMIN with Sim Card 0818 08888 915, white with a picture and the writing " Mrs Julia oh Julia "	46.000	3.700.000	July 25, 2018	Sold at auction
2017	Budi Supriyanto	1 (one) Apple smartphone, Model A1688 (Apple Iphone 6 S) serial number F4GQN3BCGRY9 with Sim Card 0813 10 333 030, silver color with black X Level cover.	1.646.000			
2016	Ade Swara dan Nurlatifah	Sebidang tanah seluas 566 m ² dan bangunan seluas 500 m ² diatasnya yang terletak di jalan Pulo Raya IV/30 RT 006/01, Kelurahan Petogogan, Kecamatan Kebayoran Baru, Jakarta Selatan, Propinsi DKI Jakarta sesuai dengan sertifikat Hak Milik No. 448 / Petogogan atas nama ALI HAMIDI yang diterbitkan oleh Kantor Pertanahan Jakarta Selatan.	7.654.103.000		July 25, 2018	Unsold at auction/No bid
2016	Fuad Amin Imron	Land and building as in Rights of Use Building Document Number 2489 Wiyung Sub-district, Wiyung Urban Ward located at Jl. Wiyung Permai Barat IV, Blok A-II / 57, with a 544 m ² land in the name of Choddin / Haji Abdul Rochman registered by Notary Shinta Ameliawaty, SH under Sales and Purchase Act no. 244/2004 entered between seller PT. Dian Permana represented by Agus Wibisono and buyer Choddin/ Haji Abdul Rochman domiciled at Jl. Sidorame Baru 15-C Surabaya, in front of Notary Shinta Ameliawaty, SH regarding a land plot at Jl. Wiyung Permai Barat IV, Blok A-II/57 Wiyung Sub-district, Wiyung Urban Ward, Surabaya , for a price of Rp.544,000,000,- on June 1, 2004.	5.223.673.000	5.788.999.999	September 26, 2018	Sold at auction
2016	Fuad Amin Imron	Land and building at Kav AAL-078, Villa Bukit Indah Cluster, Pakuwon Indah Housings as stipulated in the document of Report of Handover of Kav. AAL-078 on September 9, 2004, Deed of Sale No 1978/2004 of Desember 22, 2004 of Notary/Certifier of Land Deed Agnes Ninik Mutiara W, SH. And SHGB no 742/ Lidah Wetan Urban Ward in the name of Moh. Ismaon Bisri.	4.889.027.000	4.890.000.000	26 September 2018	Sold at auction
2016	Fuad Amin Imron	1 (one) Unit of land and building at the Graha Famili Residential Complex in Pradahkali Kendal Urban Ward, Dukuh Pakis Sub-district, Surabaya City, with the following specifications: Number: 1 (one) Unit. - House Type: SALVIA /436. - Land Surface: +/- 375M ² . - Floor Surface: +/- 399M ² .	5.780.605.000	6.288.888.888	26 September 2018	Sold at auction
2016	Fuad Amin Imron	1 (one) Honda Type ODYSSEY RB1 2.4 AT car unit, metallic black, with registration plate number L 1607 VL, Engine Number: K24A65003795, Frame Number: JHMRB18708C203795, and 1 (one) Honda car key with a black doll keychain and 1 (one) vehicle registration card in the name of NOR FAUZI No. 0286588/JT/2013 valid until September 16, 2018 and 1 (one) PKB/BBN-KB Local Tax Assessment Card Dan SWDKLLJ No. 07146876 valid until September 16, 2015. Condition: Smooth/No scratch	190.303.000		12 September 2018	Unsold at auction
2016	Fuad Amin Imron	1 (one) TOYOTA Type LANDCR 4.5L AT car unit, black with registration plate L 0081 SM, Engine number: 1VDO154964, Frame Number: JTMHV05J304072714, and 1 (one) remote car key and 1 (one) vehicle registration card in the name of PADLI No. 1404862/JT/2012 valid until February 21, and 1 (one) PKB/BBN-KB Local Tax Assessment and SWDKLLJ card No. 4509907 valid until February 21, 2014. Car Condition: smooth/ No scratch	1.143.924.000		12 September 2018	Unsold at auction

EFFECTIVE YEAR	NAME OF CONVICT	DETAILS OF EVIDENCE	FAIR VALUE (Rp)	SOLD VALUE (Rp)	AUCTION DATE	REMARKS
2016	Fuad Amin Imron	1 (one) Toyota car unit of the NAV 2.0 AT type, black with registration plate L 1796 WY, Engine Number: 3ZRB092161, Frame Number: MHFX2RB71D8000904, and 1 (one) silver Toyota car key along with 1 (one) Car Registration Card in the name of S NURJATI No. 2161267/JT/2012 valid up and including April 10, 2018 and 1 (one) regional Tax Assessment Letter PKB/ BBN-KB and SWDKLLJ No. 10373684 valid up and including April 10, 2015. And 1 (one) Car Registry Book number J-06619544 for a NAV 1 2.0 V AT Toyota car in the name of SITI NURJATI. Condition: Smooth with no scratches. Reserve tire and jack were included.	209.442.000		12 September 2018	Unsold at auction
2016	Fuad Amin Imron	1 (one) White Honda Civic FD1 1.8AT car with registration plate number L 1766 WJ, Engine Number: R18A18910356, Frame Number: MRHFD1640AP011377, and 1 (one) Honda car key and 1 (one) Car Registration Card in the name of AMNA SUSILOWATI No. 1912961/JT/2010 valid up to and including November 23, 2015.	140.375.000	120.000.000	12 September 2018	Sold at auction
2016	Fuad Amin Imron	1 (one) Toyota car unit of the NAV 2.0 AT type, Metallic White, with registration plate L 1830 QS, Engine Number: ANH20-8182058, Frame Number: 2AZH663504, with its Toyota car key included, with one original Car Registration Card in the name of LUDFI No. 0932685/JT/1 20112013 141 A valid up and including November 20, 2018 and 1 (one) original Tax receipt for PKB/BBN-KB and SWDKLLJ No.3313602 valid up and including November 20, 2014.	223.126.000	138.138.138	12 September 2018	Sold at auction
2016	Fuad Amin Imron	1 (one) unit of a white Alphard car with registration plate L1956 M with an engine number and a frame number as well as key.	368.578.000		12 September 2018	Unsold at auction
2015	Machfud Suroso	Land and building at Blok Pasir Reungit, Jayabakti Village, Cidahu Sub-district, Sukabumi District, West Java based on Freehold Certificate number 150/Jayabakti	415.392.000	416.100.000	May 17, 2018	Sold at auction
2014	M. NAZARUDDIN	1 (one) asset in the form of a land and a building on it, under Freehold Certificate number 1641, and 1 (one) original Land Freehold Title Book Number 1641 in the name of AMIN ANDOKO located at Jl. Tuanku Tambusai (formerly Jl. Nangka) Number B3, Labuh Baru Barat Urban Ward, Payung Sekaki Sub-district, Pekanbaru, Riau.	1.329.581.000		August 27, 2018	Unsold at auction
2014	M. NAZARUDDIN	1 (one) unit of land with a building, 88 m2, at Jl. Jenderal Sudirman Sudirman City Square Complex, Blok E10 South Tangkerang, Pekanbaru, Riau, based on 1 (one) original Land Freehold Title Book No. 1918 South Tangkerang Village, Bukit Raya Sub-district, Pekanbaru City, Riau, in the name of NAZIR RAHMAT	2.957.150.000		August 27, 2018	Unsold at auction
2016	M. NAZARUDDIN	1 (one) unit of land with a building at Jl Abdullah Syafii No. 19 RT 004 Rw 01 Manggarai Selatan Urban Ward, Tebet Sub-district, South Jakarta as in Land Freehold Title Book No. 1190/Manggarai Selatan (187 m2) and Land Freehold Title Book No. 1191/Manggarai Selatan (123 m2) and the following documents: 1 (one) original Building Use Title Book No. 745/ Pejaten Barat (previously Freehold Title Book No.3020/ Pejaten Barat). (BB No. 1023.1)	14.242.433.000		July 25, 2018	Unsold at auction
2016	M. NAZARUDDIN	1 (one) Land plot with building at Jalan Samali Ujung Komplek LAN BlokD No. RT010/04, Pejaten barat urban Ward, Pasar Minggu Sub-district, South Jakarta Municipality, as stipulated in the Land Usage Rights Book No 745/Pejaten Barat (previously Freehold Land Title Book N0.3020) concerning a plot of 127 m2, with 1 (one) original Freehold Land TUsage Rights Book No. 745/ Pejaten Barat (previously Freehold Title Number 3020/Pejaten Barat). (BB No. 1023.1)	1.539.164.000		July 25, 2018	Unsold at auction

EFFECTIVE YEAR	NAME OF CONVICT	DETAILS OF EVIDENCE	FAIR VALUE (Rp)	SOLD VALUE (Rp)	AUCTION DATE	REMARKS
2016	M. NAZARUDDIN	1 (one) Land plot with building at Ruko Bekasi Mas, Kavling A-12A, Kavling A-14 Margajaya Bekasi Selatan, Bekasi District as stipulated in Land Usage Rights (HGB) 449/Kel Margajaya, Land Usage Rights 450/Kel Margajaya, and Land Usage Rights 451/Kel Margajaya	6.024.757.000		14 Agustus 2018	Unsold at auction
2016	M. NAZARUDDIN	1 (one) asset in the form of a land plot with building under Freehold Title Number 2551, 120 m2 (hundred and twenty square meters) in the name of. UNANG SUDRAJAT located at Block J No. 9, the Attorney General's Complex in South pasar Minggu. 1 (one) original Freehold Title Book 2551 in the name of UNANG SUDRAJAT located at Block J number 9, Attorney General's complex in Pasar Minggu, South Jakarta. (BB No. 1156)	1.982.594.000		25 Juli 2018	Unsold at auction
2016	FL. Tri Satriya Santosa	1(one) white Apple Iphone, S/N: DNRQJ4FGRY6, IMEI: 353311076410715, iccd: 8962111431150421135, with white and black stripped SPIGEN brand, XL SIM card number: 08170075553	3.121.000	6.000.000	25 Juli 2018	Sold at auction
2016	FL. Tri Satriya Santosa	1 (one) BLACKBERRY, Type Q5 handphone, Model Number: SQR11-3, PIN: 2B1272D5, IMEI: 356969050364880, with a Telkomsel SIM card and a 2GB SanDisk memory card and a transparent black CAPDASE brand casing.	208.000		25 Juli 2018	Sold at auction
2016	FL. Tri Satriya Santosa	1 (one) black SONY XPERIA handphone of the LT28i Model, IMEI:352267050561264, Serial Number: CB5A1K8YYG.	163.000		25 Juli 2018	Sold at auction
2016	FL. Tri Satriya Santosa	1 (one) black SONY XPERIA handphone, E6533 Model, IMEI 1:359098062112348, IMEI 2: 359098062112355, Serial Number: CB5A25M71K.	429.000		25 Juli 2018	Sold at auction
2016	FL. Tri Satriya Santosa	1 (one) white iPhone Handphone, Model: A1586, FCC ID: BCG-E2816A. IMEI: 352069067632983, HP number: 08111237300, casing brand: UME.	1.925.000		25 Juli 2018	Sold at auction
2016	FL. Tri Satriya Santosa	1 (one) black Blackberry 9790 Handphone unit, PIN: 2B1C5F6C, IMEI: 354730055258887, Model: REC71UW, SIM Card TELKOMSEL: 6210 0000 0105 7830, 16 GB memory card of V-GEN brand, SN: G11020879, Card No: 6210000001057830, Handphone number: 0811127850	118.000		25 Juli 2018	Sold at auction

EFFECTIVE YEAR	NAME OF CONVICT	DETAILS OF EVIDENCE	FAIR VALUE (Rp)	SOLD VALUE (Rp)	AUCTION DATE	REMARKS
2013	M. NAZARUDDIN	Black Blackberry 9800, 1 (one) Blackberry hand phone of the Torch type, black (at&t) without back cover, Number Imei 353491048503524, and PIN number 25DAEEB1. It has one 4 GB microSD of the Sandisk brand, and Movistar SIM card serial number 123100583406742.	93.000	995.000	July 25, 2018	Sold at auction
2013	M. NAZARUDDIN	Black Blackberry 9700, 1(one) Blackberry hand phone of the 9700 type, black with IMEI number 3i54256048278865, and PIN number 269OEDE7, (without SIM card) and a 2GBmicroSD card of the Sandisk brand,	93.000		July 25, 2018	Sold at auction
2013	M. NAZARUDDIN	Silver Nokia C5, 1 (one) Nokia hand phone of the C-5 Type, silver, with Imei number 356989/853208/3 with a VIETTEL SIM card serial i 8984048504059001104. (BB No. 1385)	110.000		July 25, 2018	Sold at auction
2013	M. NAZARUDDIN	Black Nokia E7, 1 (one) Nokia hand phone of the E-7 type, black, sliding, without a SIM card. (BB No. 1386)	470.000		July 25, 2018	Sold at auction
2013	M. NAZARUDDIN	White Blackberry 9780, 1 (one) Blackberry Bold, white with a black back cover, IMEI number 354260041982549, PIN Number 27892530 with XL Bebas SIM card ICCID 11, 8962118919, 06671590-8 and 1 (one) blackberry M-S1battery codeBAT-14392-001. (BB No.1400)	93.000		July 25, 2018	Sold at auction
2013	M. NAZARUDDIN	Black Blackberry Charger, 1 (one) Blackberry hand Phone charger, black (BB No. 1390)	7.000		July 25, 2018	Sold at auction
2013	M. NAZARUDDIN	White MILI Power Bank, 1 (one) Power Crystal of the MILI brand, model no: HB-A10, white with its black data cable. (BB No. 1388)	28.000		July 25, 2018	Sold at auction
2013	M. NAZARUDDIN	Flashdisk, 1 (one) 4 GB Flashdisk of the Sony VAIO brand, silver. (BB No. 1387)	10.000		July 25, 2018	Sold at auction
2013	M. NAZARUDDIN	Dunhill bag	90.000		25 Juli 2018	Sold at auction
2016	M. NAZARUDDIN	1 (one) four-wheel car unit, a Toyota Vellfire 2.4 Z A/T, year 2010, black, Registration plate B 85 D, in the name of PT EXARTECH TECHNOLOGI UTAMA, with Frame number ANH20-8137558, and Engine number 2AZ-H564776, with original car registry book containing copies of: sales receipt, A Form (Letter of motorized car import) and receipt. Confiscated.	157.094.000	300.094.000	February 27, 2018	Sold at auction
2016	MARUDUT	1 (one) Apple hand phone, Model: A1530, FCC ID: BCG-E2643A, IC: 579C-E2643A, IMEI: 358691053092361, dark silver with SIM card and Black casing of the KA brand.	894.000		July 25, 2018	Unsold at auction
2016	MARUDUT	1 (one) Apple hand phone, Model: A1586, FCC ID: BCG-E2816A, IC: 579C-E2816A, IMEI: 358360067803979, dark silver with a SIM card and a transparent casing.	1.925.000		July 25, 2018	Unsold at auction
2016	MARUDUT	1 (one) Apple hand phone, Model: A1533, FCC ID: BCG-E2642A, IC: 579C-E2642A, IMEI: 357989058523872, dark silver with SIM card and transparent casing	894.000		July 25, 2018	Unsold at auction
2016	MARUDUT	1 (one) Apple hand phone, Model: A1549, FCC ID: BCG-E2816A, IC: 579C-E2816A IMEI: 358373063898489, grey with a SIM card and a transparent casing.	1.925.000		July 25, 2018	Unsold at auction

EFFECTIVE YEAR	NAME OF CONVICT	DETAILS OF EVIDENCE	FAIR VALUE (Rp)	SOLD VALUE (Rp)	AUCTION DATE	REMARKS
2016	MARUDUT	1 (one) Apple hand phone, Model: A1586, FCC ID: BCG-E2816A, IC: 579C-E2816A, IMEI: 352032077654645, grey and with a Halo SIM card.	1.890.000		July 25, 2018	Unsold at auction
2016	MARUDUT	1 (one) Apple hand phone, Model: A1586, FCC ID: BCG-E2816A, IC: 579C-E2816A, IMEI: 35926066103123, grey with SIM card and casing of Moshi brand.	1.925.000		July 25, 2018	Unsold at auction
2014	M. AKIL MOCHTAR	CONFISCATION 1 (ONE) TOYOTA CROWN 2.5 ATHLETE G A/T CAR UNIT, OF YEAR 2013, BLACK WITH FRAME NUMBER GRS210-6009155 REGISTRATION PLATE B1614 AND CAR KEY. AKIL MOCHTAR	941.650.000		July 25, 2018	Unsold at auction
2017	Muhamad Sanusi	1 (one) car key for Jaguar car registration number B 123 RX. (BB 171). 1 (one) metallic black Jaguar car unit, registration plate B 123 RX, frame number SAJAC26AID8V43230. (BB 172).	488.661.000	599.661.000	February 27, 2018	Sold at auction
2017	Lutfi Hasan Ishaq	1 (one) car key for VW Caravelle registration number B 948 RFS.	279.623.000	323.623.000	February 27, 2018	Sold at auction
2017	Muhamad Sanusi	1 (one) plot of land with house on it, at Permata Regency Blok F No.1, Jl. H Kelik RT 007 RW 005, Srengseng Urban Ward, Kembangan Sub-district, West Jakarta as in Sales and Purchase Act Number 41 of 2015 dated June 25, 2015 with Land Registry Notary ANNE MEYANNE ALWIE, SH and Land Freehold Title Nook No.8852/Srengseng with a land surface of 206 m2. Including all its content, as in the attached STPBB copy No-1004/23/07/2016 of July 13, 2016 from NAOMI SHALLIMA. (BB.311). 5 (five) sheets of legalized copies of Land Freehold Certificate No 8852 Srengseng Urban Ward, Kembangan Sub-district, West Jakarta Municipality. (BB 312). 5 (five) sheets of legalized copies of Sales and Purchase Act Number: 41/2015 from Land Registry Notary Anne Meyanne Alwie SH 2 (two) copies of Handover Report for a unit of the Calia Apartment on April 27, 2016 PT Indo Marine Square and Mohamad Sanusi. (BB.351).	4.426.883.000	4.427.000.000	July 25, 2018	Sold at auction
2017	Muhamad Sanusi	1 (one) plot of land with building Jl. Raya Tengah No. 68 Gg. Mushollah RT. 04/09, Tengah Urban Ward, Kramat Jati Sub-district, East Jakarta as in Freehold Certificate No. 405 for a land with a surface of 330 m2 and Freehold Certificate No. 1917 for a land with a surface of 469 m2. (BB.412) 1 (one) Original Certificate (Proof of Rights) from the East Jakarta Municipal Land Office AD 635938 09.04.03.05.1.00405 for a plot of land of 330m2 (Freehold title No. 405). (BB.413). 1 (one) Original Certificate (Proof of Rights) from the East Jakarta Municipal Land Office AV 415274 09.04.04.05.1.01917 for a 469 m2 plot of land (Freehold Title No. 01917). (BB.414).	4.407.444.000		July 25, 2018	Unsold at auction
2017	Muhamad Sanusi	1 (one) plot of land with building at Jalan Saidi I number 23, RT 011 RW 007, North Cipete urban ward, Kebayoran Baru, South Jakarta as in Freehold Certificate No. 4705/Cipete Utara for a 410 m2 land. Including its content as in the attachment to a Report of Confiscation dated July 27, 2016. (BB.424).	10.040.428.000	10.545.000.000	July 25, 2018	Sold at auction

EFFECTIVE YEAR	NAME OF CONVICT	DETAILS OF EVIDENCE	FAIR VALUE (Rp)	SOLD VALUE (Rp)	AUCTION DATE	REMARKS
2014	Deviardi	1 (one) black 2013 Toyota Camry car, Frame Number: MR053CK50D4500637, Engine Number: 2AR U044495 in the name of Deviardi Jl. Hortikultura No 15 RT 008 RW 006 Jatipadang Pasar Minggu	215.216.000	215.216.000	December 4, 2018	
2017	Yan Anton Ferdian	Women's ring, white gold with diamonds 2,23 CRT	99.610.000	100.000.000	July 25, 2018	Sold at auction
2017	Yan Anton Ferdian	2014 Mercedes Benz GL 400 AT car, registration plate B 8400 GK	711.000.000	1.010.000.000	July 25, 2018	Sold at auction
2017	Yan Anton Ferdian	1 (one) black 2011 Harley Davidson motorcycle, registration plate B 6168 SFY with its engine key	260.943.000	337.325.000	September 14, 2018	Sold at auction
2017	Yan Anton Ferdian	1 (one) pearl black 2015 Honda City GM6 1.5 E CVT car, registration number BG-75-MR, Frame Number: MHRGM6640FP411957, Engine Number: L15Z11423468, in the name of SUTARYO, domicile at Jl. Cahaya Berlian RT/RW. 21/08 Pangkalan Balai Urban Ward, Banyuasin III Sub-district, as well as:	233.073.000	117.349.000	September 14, 2018	Sold at auction
2017	Yan Anton Ferdian	<ol style="list-style-type: none"> 1. (one) knocked down 1970 Toyota Hardtop FJ40 car, registration plate H-8636-BA, composed of: 2. 1 (one) unit of unpainted car body 3. 1 (one) frame unit 4. 2 (two) units of differential gear 5. 4 (four) tires of the Savero ring 15 brand, and 6. 1 (one) unit of original Toyota Hardtop FJ40 engine 7. 1 (one) Car Registration Book No. 728806 G 8. 1 (one) copy of Car Registration Card No.:557614 /JG/990 	10.533.000		January 31, 2018	Unsold at auction
2017	Jefferson Soleiman Montesqieu Rumajar	1 (one) black 2008 Ford New Everest 2.5L XLT 4X2 AT car, Frame Number: MNBLS4D108W210782, Engine Number: WLAT 942869	84.984.000	89.006.007	March 6, 2018	Sold at auction
2017	Bambang Irianto	1 (one) black 2011 5,000 cc gasoline-fueled Landrover jeep of the Ranger Rover 5.0L V8 AT type, registration plate B 111 RUE, name of owner Diana Mufida, address: Sari bumi Indah Blok D-4/15 RT 005/017 Binong Curug, Tangerang District, Frame Number: NIK/ VIN SALLMAME3BA357592, Engine Number: 11060123054508PS, with 1 (one) original Car Registration Card, 1 (one) Tax Assessment Letter, 1 (one) original Car Registration Book and 1 (one) remote control key.	883.559.000		August 28, 2018	Unsold at auction/No bid
2017	Bambang Irianto	1 (one) white, 1598 cc gasoline-fueled 2010 Mini Copper 1.6 AT car, registration plate B 1279 GGY, name of owner: Muhammad Nur Robby, address: Sari Bumi Indah BLK D-4/15 RT.005 RW 017 Kel. Binong Urban Ward, Curug Sub-district, Tangerang District, Frame Number: NIK/ VIN WMWMS32060TJ93244, Engine Number: A0781585, with 1 (one) original Car Registration Card, 1 (one) Tax Assessment Letter, 1 (one) original Car Registration Book and 1 (one) round car key.	282.175.000		August 28, 2018	Unsold at auction/No bid

EFFECTIVE YEAR	NAME OF CONVICT	DETAILS OF EVIDENCE	FAIR VALUE (Rp)	SOLD VALUE (Rp)	AUCTION DATE	REMARKS
2017	Bambang Irianto	1 (one) white, 6162 cc gasoline-fueled 2010 H2 Hummer car, registration plate B 11 RRU, name of owner: M. Sjahrullah Sarfian, Address: Jl. Tn Abang 1/2 RT 6/8 Gambir, Central Jakarta, Frame Number: NIK/VIN 5GRGN232X9H100807, Engine Number: X9H100807, with 1 (one) original Car Registration Card, 1 (one) Tax Assessment Letter, 1 (one) original Car Registration Book, and 1 (one) key as well as: a. 1 (one) bundle of documents composed of Car Invoice from PT. Tareo Utamakarya Number: 393/TUK-NA/ XII/2010 of April 18, 2011 in the name of PUTRI AYUNIATY, Car Identity: HUMMER brand, Type: H2, Year of manufacture: 2010, with documents composed of Letter of Notification on Import of Vehicle and Vehicle Identification Number (BB No.670)	2.314.559.000		August 28, 2018	Unsold at auction/No bid
2017	Bambang Irianto	1 (one) black, 3778 cc gasoline-fueled 2009 jeep of the Wrangler 3.8 T type, registration plate B 11 RUE, with owner's name: Bovie Irlisa, Address Jl. Ros Merah J/12 RT 4/16 Cipmuara JT, Frame Number/NIK/VIN 1J4GE39149L709615, Engine Number 9L709615, with 1 (one) original Car Registration Card, 1 (one) Tax Assessment Letter, 1 (one) original Car Registration Book and 1 (one) car key.	358.440.000	379.000.000	August 28, 2018	Sold at auction
2014	LUTHFI HASAN ISHAQ	1 (one) black 2012 Toyota FJ Cruiser 4.0 A/T registration plate B 1240 THE	578.955.000	697.727.000	March 16, 2018	Sold at auction
2014	LUTHFI HASAN ISHAQ	1 (one) black FJ Cruiser 4.0 L WD car with Frame Number: JTEBU 11 F 30 K134958, Engine Number 1 GR-A453811	479.277.000	638.277.000	February 27, 2018	Sold at auction
2017	Amran Hi Mustary	Apple iPhone 5S 64 GB with violet casing with floral motive, PIN 1100222	980.000	3.300.000	July 25, 2018	Sold at auction
2017	Amran Hi Mustary	White Apple iPhone 6 64 GB, with series number C39PTZXL65MV	1.814.000		July 25, 2018	Sold at auction
2017	Amran Hi Mustary	1 (one) d black Samsung Galaxy Grand Prime handphone, SM-G531SH	432.000		July 25, 2018	Sold at auction
2017	OJANG SOHANDI	White Nissan Frontier 2.5 A/T Double Cabin car	185.400.000	185.400.000	December 4, 2018	
2017	I Putu Sudiartana	White Vivo Y21 Handphone	259.000	16.875.000	April 4, 2018	
2017	Musa Zainuddin	1 (one) white IP Phone handphone A1533, IMEI: 013883006084000	667.000	3.300.000	July 25, 2018	Sold at auction
2017	Musa Zainuddin	1 (one) white IP Phone S, A 1688 model, FCC ID: BCG-E294 6A IC: 579C-E2946A black hard casing	1.199.000		July 25, 2018	Sold at auction
2017	Musa Zainuddin	1 (one) electronic equipment, a black Nokia Microsoft Mobile classic candybar handphone of the RM 1038 Model, Code 059W062 with 1 Telkomsel SIM Card.	54.000		July 25, 2018	Sold at auction
2017	Atty Suharti dan Itoc Tochija	1 (one) Galaxy S7 Edge handphone, number: 08112001351	1.980.000	9.057.000	December 4, 2018	
2017	Saipul Jamil	Electronic equipment, a dark blue Nokia handphone of the RM 1134 Model	86.000		July 25, 2018	Unsold at auction
2017	Saipul Jamil	1 (one) black iPhone 6 Model 98000 handphone	762.000		July 25, 2018	Unsold at auction
2017	Saipul Jamil	1 (one) white Blackberry 98000 handphone	126.000		July 25, 2018	Unsold at auction
2017	Saipul Jamil	1 (one) Samsung Model GT-i9300 handphone	295.000		July 25, 2018	Unsold at auction
2017	Saipul Jamil	1 (one) Apple A 1524 handphone, model MGA824PA/A	3.065.000		July 25, 2018	Unsold at auction

EFFECTIVE YEAR	NAME OF CONVICT	DETAILS OF EVIDENCE	FAIR VALUE (Rp)	SOLD VALUE (Rp)	AUCTION DATE	REMARKS
2017	Saipul Jamil	1 (one) Apple A 1524 handphone, FCC ID: BCG-E2817A	1.646.000		July 25, 2018	Unsold at auction
2017	Saipul Jamil	1 (one) Apple A 1586 handphone	1.050.000		July 25, 2018	Unsold at auction
2017	Saipul Jamil	1 (one) electronic equipment, a black Digital Video Recorder	187.000		July 25, 2018	Unsold at auction
2014	Surya Dharma Ali	1 (one) black Kiswah cloth (Ka'bah cover cloth) 80 cm x 90 cm inscribed with golden Arabic calligraphy	22.500.000	450.000.000	July 25, 2018	Unsold at auction
2018	Amir Mirza Hutagalung	1 (one) Noon Stone 1980 Chevrolet car, LUV DSL/ KBD40 type, registration number H 1663 JP, Frame No. KBD40949550200, Engine No.516570 with 2 (two) keys each inscribed with "TORICA" and "N1874", and: 1 (one) Vehicle Registration Card No. 0139465 for a Noon Stone 1980 Chevrolet car, LUV DSL/ KBD40 type, registration number H 1663 JP, Frame No. KBD40949550200, Engine No.516570 with the name of owners: SULASTRI	16.820.000	19.399.999	September 4, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Amir Mirza Hutagalung	1 (one) blue 1995 Toyota Kijang KF 50 STD registration plate B 9159 NB, Frame No. MHF31KF5000192947, Engine no. 5K9282163 with 1 (one) key inscribed with "TOYOTA MOTOR K3832", and 1 (one) Vehicle registration Card No. 2454699 for a blue 1995 Toyota Kijang KF 50 STD registration plate B 9159 NB, Frame No. MHF31KF5000192947, Engine no. 5K9282163 with name of owner Drs. GUNUNG BUDIARTO. S.MA with 1 (one) Regional Tax Assessment Letter PKB/BBN-KB and SWKLLJ, Number: AH 1290190	18.486.000	20.486.000	September 14, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Amir Mirza Hutagalung	1 (one) 2015 Yamaha Bison 45 P No.Pol B 6966 PZS, in the name of Riski De Sauza, Frame No. MH345P005FK297196, Engine No. 45P307173 with Key a. Vehicle Registration Card (STNK) for 2015 Yamaha Bison 45 P motorcycle No B 6966 PZS, in the name of Riski De Sauza, Frame No. MH345P005FK297196, Engine No. 45P307173 b. 1 (one) Vehicle Ownership Book for a Motorcycle of the Yamaha brand with registration number buah B 6966 PZS Frame No. MH345P0057K297196 with name of owner: Riski De Sauza	8.529.000		September 4, 2018	Unsold at auction
2018	Amir Mirza Hutagalung	1 (one) 2015 Yamaha Bison No B 3512 STP in the name of Dhana Arino Akbar, Frame No. MH3RG1910FK005299, Engine No. G3E8E0005246 with keys and: 1 (one) brown wallet containing a photocopy of a Vehicle Registration Card for a 2015 Yamaha Bison motorcycle No B 3512 STP in the name of Dhana Arino Akbar, Frame No. MH3RG1910FK005299, Engine No. G3E8E0005246	8.529.000		September 4, 2018	Unsold at auction
2018	Amir Mirza Hutagalung	1 (one) 2015 Yamaha Bison motorcycle No B 4067 TLQ, in the name of Ade Agus Sumaedi, Frame Number MH345P005FK301752, Engine Number 45P311810 with key and: a. 1 (one) brown wallet containing a Vehicle Registration Card for 1 (one) 2015 Yamaha Bison No B 4067 TLQ in the name of Ade Agus Sumaedi, Frame Number MH345P005FK301752, Engine Number 45P311810 b. 1 (one) Vehicle Ownership Book for Yamaha motorcycle registration plate B 4067 TLQ, Frame Number MH345P0057FK301752, in the name of owner Ade Agus Sumaedi	8.742.000		September 4, 2018	Unsold at auction

EFFECTIVE YEAR	NAME OF CONVICT	DETAILS OF EVIDENCE	FAIR VALUE (Rp)	SOLD VALUE (Rp)	AUCTION DATE	REMARKS
2018	Amir Mirza Hutagalung	1 (one) Yamaha Bison motorcycle, No B 3260 SPX with a. 1 (one) brown wallet with key, 1 9one Vehicle Registration Card for a Yamaha type 45P Bison motorcycle registration plate B 3260 SPX Frame No. MH345P005EK290316 with as owner: Tiah b. 1 (one) Vehicle Registration Book for a Motorcycle for a Yamaha type 45P Bison motorcycle registration plate B 3260 SPX Frame No. MH345P005EK290316 with as owner: Tiah with a receipt from Mr. H. Imam for Rp11,000,000,- on July 28, 2017	7.997.000		September 4, 2018	Unsold at auction
2018	Amir Mirza Hutagalung	1 (one)black Yamaha RX King motorcycle, registration plate G 3568 SE, Frame No. MH33KA0102K529839, Engine No. 3KA503892 with 2 (two) keys inscribed with Yamaha and: a. 1 (one) Vehicle Registration Card for a black Yamaha RX King motorcycle, registration plate G 3568 SE, Frame No. MH33KA0102K529839, Engine No. 3KA503892 in the name of Kustomo b. 1 (one) Vehicle Registration Book for a black Yamaha RX King motorcycle, registration plate G 3568 SE, Frame No. MH33KA0102K529839, Engine No. 3KA503892 in the name of Kustomo, and a receipt from Mr. H. Amir Mirza SE for Rp20,000,000,- dated July 25, 2017.	8.044.000	15.044.000	September 14, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Amir Mirza Hutagalung	1 (one) gold Samsung handphone, Model: SM-G930FD, S/N: RR8H307KE5H, IMEI 1: 358432070084010, IMEI 2: 358433070084018 Containing a SIM Card (white with the picture and writing faded) without memory card and with a transparent soft casing.	1.273.000	12.187.000	September 14, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Bambang Wuryanto	1 (one) dark red precious stone	29.000	400.000	July 25, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Bambang Wuryanto	1 (one) purple precious stone	29.000		July 25, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Parlin Purba	Nokia RM-1134 handphone, IMEI 359754063404452	53.000	90.000	July 25, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Parlin Purba	1 (one) Nokia handphone of the RH130 type	37.000		July 25, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Mochamad Basuki, R. Rahman Agung dan Santoso	1 (one) brown leather bag of the 'COACH New York' brand	1.314.000	1.314.000	July 25, 2018	Sold at auction
2015	Kwee Cahyadi alias Swie Teng	1 (one) Samsung handphone of the SM J500/DS model	230.000	4.394.000	December 4, 2018	
2018	Moh. Ka'bil Mubarok	1 (one) black iPhone	887.000	4.200.000	July 25, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Moh. Ka'bil Mubarok	1 (one) Samsung handphone of the SM J500/DS model	361.000		July 25, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Moh. Ka'bil Mubarok	1 (one) Black LG handphone	196.000		July 25, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Moh. Ka'bil Mubarok	1 (one) Black Blackberry Q10	99.000		July 25, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Moh. Ka'bil Mubarok	1 (one) Gold Samsung Galaxy Note 5	595.000		July 25, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Moh. Ka'bil Mubarok	1 (one) Black iPhone 5 A1429	370.000		July 25, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Moh. Ka'bil Mubarok	1 (one) Samsung Galaxy S 7 Edge handphone, Model: SMG935FD	868.000		July 25, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Moh. Ka'bil Mubarok	1 (one) White Samsung handphone, Model: SM A300H/DS	391.000		July 25, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Moh. Ka'bil Mubarok	1 (one) Dark Blue Samsung handphone, Model: SM J110G	306.000		July 25, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Antonius Tony Budiono	1 (one) Brown Samsung Galaxy Note 4 handphone, Model: SM-N910H, IMEI: 356001060905112, S/N: RF1FC0AHAAP, with Indosat SIM card Code No. 62013000109642933. With 64 GB ADATA memory card, without password, was in the hands of Antonius Tonny Budiono	925.000	8.848.000	December 4,2018	Sold at auction

EFFECTIVE YEAR	NAME OF CONVICT	DETAILS OF EVIDENCE	FAIR VALUE (Rp)	SOLD VALUE (Rp)	AUCTION DATE	REMARKS
2018	Antonius Tony Budiono	1 (one) 21 carat gold necklace, weighing 19.62 grams. 88% gold	8.767.000	9.267.000	December 4, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Antonius Tony Budiono	1 (one) 21 carat gold bracelet set, weighing 16.23 grams	7.253.000	7.253.000	December 4, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Antonius Tony Budiono	1 (one) 23 carat gold ring weighing 4.96 grams	2.422.000	2.522.000	December 4, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Antonius Tony Budiono	2 (two) 23 carat gold bracelet, weighing 25.49 grams	12.445.000	12.945.000	December 4, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Antonius Tony Budiono	1 (one) 18 carat gold chain weighing 13.48 grams	5.187.000	5.187.000	December 4, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Antonius Tony Budiono	1 (one) 18 carat gold chain bracelet, weighing 7 grams.	2.694.000		December 4, 2018	No bid
2018	Antonius Tony Budiono	1 (one) 16 carat gold Garuda emblem, 9.98 grams	3.427.000	3.827.000	December 4, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Antonius Tony Budiono	1 (one) ring, believed to be made of gold, with tosca blue gem stone rimmed with what is believed to be diamonds, in a red velvet box.	271.000	521.000	December 4, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Antonius Tony Budiono	1 (one) 18 karat gold ring, 10.99 grams, with light blue gem stone and diamonds	4.189.000	4.189.000	December 4, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Antonius Tony Budiono	1 (one) suspected gold ring, with a black gem stone, rimmed with what looks like diamonds	9.486.000	9.486.000	December 4, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Antonius Tony Budiono	1 (one) 20 carat gold ring, 15.8 grams, with purple gem stone	6.485.000	6.485.000	December 4, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Antonius Tony Budiono	1 (one) 16 carat gold ring, 14.18 grams, with a clear green precious stone	4.934.000	4.934.000	December 4, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Antonius Tony Budiono	1 (one) ring suspected to be made of gold with black gem stone	5.759.000	5.759.000	December 4, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Antonius Tony Budiono	1 (one) 18 carat gold ring, 22.15 grams, with blue gem stone	13.502.000	14.002.000	December 4, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Antonius Tony Budiono	1 (one) ring suspected to be made of platinum, with square black precious stone and rimmed with what is believed to be diamonds set in a transparent frame	4.363.000	6.263.000	December 4, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Antonius Tony Budiono	1 (one) 14 carat platinum ring, 25.37 grams, with orange precious stone and 142 diamonds	13.365.000	13.865.000	December 4, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Antonius Tony Budiono	1 (one) ring, not of gold, with tosca green precious stone	226.000	676.000	December 4, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Antonius Tony Budiono	1 (one) ring, not of gold, with dark pink precious stone	249.000	849.000	December 4, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Antonius Tony Budiono	1 (one) 14 carat platinum ring, 29.82 grams, with moss green gem and 56 diamonds	11.334.000	11.334.000	December 4, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Antonius Tony Budiono	1 (one) 10 carat platinum ring, 29.39 grams, with dark green gem, 93 diamonds and 1 chalcedony	12.851.000	12.851.000	December 4, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Antonius Tony Budiono	1 (one) 12 carat platinum ring, 22.57 grams with maroon red stone and 60 diamonds, 1 ruby	8.550.000	8.550.000	December 4, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Antonius Tony Budiono	1 (one) 14 carat platinum ring, 21.71 grams, with clear white stone, 221 diamonds, 1 crystal quartz	16.118.000	16.618.000	December 4, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Antonius Tony Budiono	1 (one) 12 carat platinum ring, 16.63 grams with dark blue gem, 54 diamonds, 1 blue sapphire	6.923.000	7.423.000	December 4, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Antonius Tony Budiono	1 (one) non-gold ring with tosca green gem stone	226.000	1.026.000	December 4, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Antonius Tony Budiono	1 (one) white box inscribed with EMPORIO ARMANI containing watch with label AR5964	1.605.000	1.905.000	December 4, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Antonius Tony Budiono	1 (one) silver box inscribed with Gc containing watch with brown leather strap	3.119.000	3.219.000	December 4, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Antonius Tony Budiono	1 (one) Guess watch in grey box inscribed with GC Guess, with warranty card	3.767.000	3.967.000	December 4, 2018	Sold at auction

EFFECTIVE YEAR	NAME OF CONVICT	DETAILS OF EVIDENCE	FAIR VALUE (Rp)	SOLD VALUE (Rp)	AUCTION DATE	REMARKS
2018	Antonius Tony Budiono	1 (one) dark brown Tissot watch in black and red box with warranty card	1.395.000	2.495.000	December 4, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Antonius Tony Budiono	1 (one) Charriol watch	19.824.000		December 4, 2018	No bid
2018	Antonius Tony Budiono	1 (satu) Alba watch with dark brown leather strap in black box, with warranty card	797.000	897.000	December 4, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Antonius Tony Budiono	1 (satu) Quantum "The Big Time" with leather strap in black box with warranty card	727.000	877.000	December 4, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Antonius Tony Budiono	1 (one) TUDOR watch with chain strap in black box with one black strap and warranty book	31.358.000	31.358.000	December 4, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Antonius Tony Budiono	1 (one) Bulova women's watch with brown leather strap	749.000	1.099.000	December 4, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Antonius Tony Budiono	1 (one) Mont Blanc pen in black box MBLG5J5S 5	2.958.000	5.220.000	December 4, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Antonius Tony Budiono	1 (one) Mont Blanc pen, Leather Goods Meisterstuck Selection 112983	8.797.000	8.797.000	December 4, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Antonius Tony Budiono	1 (one) ST Dupont pen and miniature car 0152/1929 in a black box	8.564.000	8.564.000	December 4, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Antonius Tony Budiono	1 (one) black ST Dupont leather wallet in black box	1.834.000	3.316.000	December 4, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Antonius Tony Budiono	Brown Polo Winstar backpack	58.000	2.260.000	December 4, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Antonius Tony Budiono	Element Gallium 2.0 bicycle	2.573.000	2.573.000	December 4, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Ali Sadli	1 (one) pearl black Honda car, Type CR-V RM3 2WD RS AT, registration plate B 246 AFF, with car key. BB No 18	264.000.000	281.000.000	December 4, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Sigit Yugiharto	1 (one) white Apple iPhone 6+ handphone with serial number F9CQF0D0G5R1 and a dark blue protection case and one Telkosel SIM card number 08128122931	2.097.000	3.797.000	December 4, 2018	Sold at auction
2018	Sigit Yugiharto	1 (one) black Harley Davidson motorcycle of the Sportster XL 883C model with VIN: 1HD4CJM10YK113320 and Engine Number 6F64912H7 and registration plate B 5662 JS (BB 161) 1 (one) key with a black Braun Buffel keychain for a black Harley Davidson motorcycle (BB 162)	72.095.000	133.095.000	December 4, 2018	Sold at auction
2009	Jules Fitzgerald Warikar	2005 black Chevrolet car purchased in 2007 registration plate O 1716 HS in the name of SEATRIKS WARIKAR with car registration card.	21.525.000	24.525.000	December 4, 2018	Sold at auction

DETERMINATION OF USAGE ALLOTMENT/GRANT FOR MINISTRIES/INSTITUTIONS/REGIONAL ADMINISTRATIONS

NO	CONVICT	TASK UNIT	DATE OF GRANT	TYPE OF GRANT	VALUE OF GOODS (IN RUPIAH)	REMARKS
1	REMARKS	1	January 30, 2018	Toyota Avanza 1.3 G	59.281.000	Usage Allotment given to the Justice and Human Rights Ministry for an operational vehicle for North Jakarta Seized Good Warehouse
	Djoko Susilo	3		Toyota Hilux 2.5 G Double Cabin	149.450.000	
2	M. Nazaruddin	1	March 8, 2018	Four storey Shophouse at Jalan Wijaya Graha Puri Blok C Nomor 15, Pulo Urban Ward, Kebayoran Baru Sub-district, South Jakarta Municipality	12.448.504.000	Usage Allotment given to the Detective Bureau (Bareskrim)
	Fuad Amin	2 & 3		Kecamatan Kebayoran Baru, Kota Jakarta Selatan, Provinsi DKI Jakarta		
3	Fuad Amin	2 & 3	April 13, 2018	One 18,666 m2 plot of land in Mlajah Urban Ward, Bangkalan Sub-district, Bangkalan District.	16.568.619.000	Usage Allotment given to the Agrarian Ministry/ National land Agency (BPN) for its East Java Regional Office.
	Fuad Amin	2 & 3		Honda Mobilio DD4		
	Fuad Amin	2 & 3		Toyota New Avanza Veloz 1.5 MT		
	Fuad Amin	2 & 3		Toyota Kijang Innova V XS43		
4	Akil Mochtar	1	July 24, 2018	Land with building at Jalan Pancoran Indah 3 No. 8, South Jakarta, DKI Jakarta with an area of 140 M2 and a built surface of 172 M2	3.033.706.000	Usage Allotment given to the Attorney General's Office of the Republic of Indonesia
	Fuad Amin	2 & 3		Toyota Fortuner 2.5 GAT M 1463 HA	274.564.000	
	Fuad Amin	2 & 3		Toyota Kijang Innova V XW43 Registration Plate L 1033 ZN	94.934.000	
	Djoko Susilo	3		Isuzu Elf Registration Plate B 9372 FG	28.380.000	
	Fuad Amin	2 & 3		Hyundai H1 2.4 L 1833 WK	100.595.000	
5	Fuad Amin	2 & 3	December 12, 2018	9 vacant plots of land at Jalan Dewi Sartika, Cawang, Kramat Jati, Jakarta Timur seluas= 4.320 M2	61.404.480.000	Usage Allotment given to KPK for a warehouse to store confiscated
6	Amran Hi Mustary	1	December 18, 2018	2 Bidang Tanah dengan Total luas= 4.195 M2 di Kabupaten Banjarnegara dan 1 Mesin AMP (Asphal Mixing Plant)	2.101.862.000	Grant for the Banjarnegara District Administration in Central Java
TOTAL					96.913.937.000	